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The service

Introduction

Colette Dorrington has been registered with the Care Inspectorate since 2002 to provide a care service to a
maximum of 6 children at any one time under the age of 16, of whom no more than 3 are not yet attending
primary school and of whom no more than 1 is under 12 months. Numbers are inclusive of children of the
childminder's family and overnight service will not be provided. The main lounge will not be used for
childminding purposes.

The childminder provides her service from her own home located within the village of Kintore, Aberdeenshire.
The property is well situated to access local schools, parks and amenities. The children have access to the
kitchen, office/playroom, dining room and bathroom. They can play with toys on a large landing with a safety
gate at the top of the stairs. There is a large park nearby for outdoor play.

Aims of the service include being committed "to provide a fun environment to meet the needs of the children
and to build a trusting open relationship with the children and parents and openly encourage communication".

What we did during our inspection

We compiled this report following an unannounced inspection, which took place on the 15 November 2017
between 9:30am and 1:30pm. The inspection was carried out by a Care Inspectorate Early Years Inspector.

During this inspection we spoke with the childminder and the two minded children present. We observed the
care given by the childminder and looked at a number of documents including children's records, health and
safety procedures and certificates of training.

We check services are meeting the principles of Getting it right for every child (also known as GIRFEC). This is
Scotland's national approach to improving outcomes and wellbeing for children by offering the right help at the
right time from the right people. It supports them and their parent(s) to work with the services that can help
them. There are eight wellbeing indicators at the heart of GIRFEC. They are: safe, healthy, achieving, nurtured,
active, respected, responsible and included. They are often referred to as the SHANARRI wellbeing indicators.

Views of people using the service

Two children aged between 12 months and two years were present during inspection. The children were too
young to talk to us but appeared happy and settled in the childminder's care.
For this inspection three parents/carers returned a completed Care Standards Questionnaires (CSQs). The
responses from these demonstrated that parents were very happy with the quality of care their child received.
Comments included:

- "Colette has a warm and friendly approach to all the children in her care. She provides a safe place for them
and a very welcoming door to parents".
- "Colette goes above and beyond to provide an excellent level of care".
- "My childminder's home is like a second home to my children. She always informs me of any issues when I see
her. She puts the welfare of my children first and is always reliable. She is very flexible and nothing is a problem
to her".
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Self assessment

We did not receive a self-assessment from the childminder. The childminder was confused and thought she had
completed the self-assessment. We discussed the importance of this document and advice was given to ensure
it is evaluative and meaningful.

What the service did well

The childminder had a warm and welcoming manner and provided a homely service which catered well to the
individual needs of the children. The children were able to choose from a range of toys and games suitable for
their age and stage of development.

What the service could do better

The childminder should develop the children's records to support a continuity of care. These must be reviewed
regularly with parents to support the overall welfare of the children. The childminder should access training and
new guidance to support and improve her service.

From this inspection we graded this service as:

Quality of care and support 4 - Good
Quality of environment 4 - Good
Quality of staffing not assessed
Quality of management and leadership 3 - Adequate

Quality of care and support

Findings from the inspection

The childminder had developed friendly and positive relationships with the families in her care and used a variety
of strategies to communicate with parents. Parents were able to speak to the childminder on a daily basis at
drop off and pick up times. Text messages and photographs of the children on special occasions were shared
with parents and a daily diary was kept for very young children. This helped them feel included and reassured
that their child was busy and happy. We discussed possible ways for the childminder to record the children's
progress and achievements.

We made a previous requirement to ensure all children have a personal plan. We found the childminder collated
information including the children's contact details and any allergy or medical needs before the child started at
the service. This helped keep the child safe and well. However, information about children's daily routines from
home, likes and dislikes were not recorded. New forms with more information to support a continuity of care
were in the process of being issued to parents. Children's records were not reviewed with parents every six
months as required by legislation (see recommendation 1).

In order to safeguard children,the childminder had a basic understanding of child protection issues and was able
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to tell us the correct procedures to follow if concerned about the welfare of a child. However, she had not
attended recent child protection to ensure her knowledge was up to date and current (see recommendation 2).

There were no children attending the service who required medication. However, to support the safe
administration of medication, a policy and recording forms were available to use.

During inspection we observed a very positive, friendly relationship between the children and the childminder.
We saw the childminder read books and play toys with the children, always modelling good speech and
encouraging early language development. The childminder encouraged the children to share toys and play nicely
together.

The childminder promoted a healthy lifestyle and provided healthy meals and snacks for the children. Water or
milk was offered to drink which supported good dental health. To support physical and emotional health,
opportunities were available for the children to play outside in the local park. Children were able to access fresh
air when walking to and from school.

Requirements

Number of requirements: 0

Recommendations

Number of recommendations: 2

1. To ensure children are kept safe in an emergency, the childminder must ensure children's records are reviewed
and updated with parents every six months or earlier if necessary.

National Care Standards Early Education and Childcare up to the age of 16. Standard 3: Health and Wellbeing and
Standard 13: Improving the Service

2. To ensure the safeguarding of children in her care, the childminder must access relevant training to improve
her knowledge and skills in relation to child protection.

National Care Standards Early Education and Childcare up to the age of 16. Standard 3: Health and Wellbeing and
Standard 12: Confidence in Staff

Grade: 4 - good

Quality of environment

Findings from the inspection

The environment was warm, comfortable and supported children's choice with a variety of age appropriate toys.
Books and interactive toys were available for young children and board games and art and craft activities were
enjoyed by the older children. The older children could relax and watch television in the kitchen.
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Opportunities for young children to sleep were available in a travel cot in the dining room. However, children
preferred to sleep in a pushchair which is not supported by Sleep Safe Scotland. To help ensure the safety of the
children, the childminder told us she would discuss this with parents and encourage children to sleep in the cot.

The childminder did not use her garden frequently for childminding purposes. It was not fully enclosed to help
keep the children safe within the boundaries of the property and children were not able to access it
independently. However, the childminder made good use of the nearby park for outdoor play opportunities. The
children were able to run around and play on the equipment to support their physical development. However,
there were fewer opportunities for children to develop their creativity and their understanding of the world
around them. The document My World Outdoors, gives examples of inexpensive outdoor play opportunities. This
can be found at: http://hub.careinspectorate.com/

The childminder made good use of the local amenities and regularly took the children to the toddler and
childminder groups. She often took the children for walks with the family dog and visited the local parks. This
developed children's confidence and respect of their local area.

The childminder completed a nappy change, ensuring the child felt safe and comfortable. However, she did not
follow best practice procedures and did not wear a disposable apron to prevent contamination. The document
Infection Prevention and Control in Childcare Settings (Sept 2015 update) should be used to support the
childminder's knowledge and understanding of infection control to help keep children safe and well. This can be
found at:
http://hub.careinspectorate.com/

In order to safeguard children, the childminder had attended first aid training and was able describe how to deal
with minor scrapes and more serious emergencies. Accidents and incidents forms were available to record any
injuries. A fully stocked first aid kit was easily accessible in the kitchen.

Requirements

Number of requirements: 0

Recommendations

Number of recommendations: 0

Grade: 4 - good

Quality of staffing

This quality theme was not assessed.
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Quality of management and leadership

Findings from the inspection

The childminder had a friendly, reassuring manner and provided a service that was supportive and caring to the
families she works with. She was a member of SCMA (Scottish Childminders Association) and had recently used
their site to develop her records and collate more information to ensure a continuity of care. A range of current
policies and procedures were available to support the service.

To help meet the needs of the children, the childminder must ensure she becomes familiar with good practice
guidance and use this improve outcomes for children. For example the childminder was not confident about her
knowledge of GIFREC (Getting it Right for every Child) and Building the ambition. The Hub on the Care
Inspectorate website should be accessed and then used to support improvement to her service (see
recommendation 1).

The childminder had not completed the Care Inspectorate self-assessment to support improvement to her
service. She was not familiar with the documents My Childminding Journey and My Childminding experience to
support evaluation of her service. These can be found at: www.hub.careinspectorate.com

The childminder had issued recent questionnaires to involve parents and children in making improvements to the
service. Responses were very positive and parents were happy with the service provided. However, we discussed
making the questionnaire more focused on specific areas and ensuring questions were open ended to fully gain
parent's views and opinions. The children were asked about what they wanted to do and the younger children
were able to choose toys and games. We discussed ways of recording the children's ideas to ensure they took
part in activities they enjoy.

Requirements

Number of requirements: 0

Recommendations

Number of recommendations: 1

1. To meet the individual needs of the children in her care, the childminder should access a range of good
practice guidance and training materials to support her to improve her knowledge and skills.

Information about Getting It Right For Every Child and SHANARRI well-being indicators can be found at:

http://www.aberdeengettingitright.org.uk/
http://www.girfec-aberdeenshire.org/
http://www.gov.scot/Topics/People/Young-People/gettingitright/well-being

Grade: 3 - adequate
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Previous requirements

Requirement 1

The provider must, after consultation with each child's parents/carers, ensure all children have a personal plan
and that the plans are regularly reviewed at least once every six months. The Social Care and Social Work
Improvement Scotland (Requirements for Care Services) Regulations 2011 SSI 2011/210 Regulation 5.

This requirement was made on 4 December 2013.

Action taken on previous requirement
We found the childminder collated information including the children's contact details and any allergy or medical
needs before the child started at the service. However, information about children's daily routines from home,
likes and dislikes were not recorded. New forms with more information to support a continuity of care were in
the process being issued to parents. Children's records were not reviewed with parents every six months as
required by legislation. This requirement had been partially met and rewritten as a recommendation.

Met - outwith timescales

Previous recommendations

Recommendation 1

The childminder should increase opportunities for children, parents and carers to be involved in the assessment
and development of the care service provided.

National Care Standards Early Education and Childcare up to the age of 16. Standard 13: Improving the Service

This recommendation was made on 4 December 2013.

Action taken on previous recommendation
The childminder had issued recent questionnaires to involve parents and children in making improvements to the
service.The children were asked about what they wanted to do and the younger children were able to choose
toys and games. This recommendation had been met. However, we discussed developing this further with more
focussed questionnaires and recording the children's ideas.

What the service has done to meet any requirements we made at
or since the last inspection

What the service has done to meet any recommendations we
made at or since the last inspection
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Complaints

There have been no complaints upheld since the last inspection. Details of any older upheld complaints are
published at www.careinspectorate.com.

Enforcement

No enforcement action has been taken against this care service since the last inspection.

Inspection and grading history

Date Type Gradings

4 Dec 2013 Announced (short notice) Care and support 4 - Good
Environment 4 - Good
Staffing 4 - Good
Management and leadership Not assessed

25 Mar 2010 Announced (short notice) Care and support 5 - Very good
Environment Not assessed
Staffing 5 - Very good
Management and leadership Not assessed

24 Feb 2009 Announced (short notice) Care and support 5 - Very good
Environment 5 - Very good
Staffing 4 - Good
Management and leadership Not assessed

Inspection report

Inspection report for Dorrington, Colette
page 8 of 9



To find out more

This inspection report is published by the Care Inspectorate. You can download this report and others from our
website.

Care services in Scotland cannot operate unless they are registered with the Care Inspectorate. We inspect, award
grades and help services to improve. We also investigate complaints about care services and can take action
when things aren't good enough.

Please get in touch with us if you would like more information or have any concerns about a care service.

You can also read more about our work online at www.careinspectorate.com

Contact us

Care Inspectorate
Compass House
11 Riverside Drive
Dundee
DD1 4NY

enquiries@careinspectorate.com

0345 600 9527

Find us on Facebook

Twitter: @careinspect

Other languages and formats

This report is available in other languages and formats on request.

Tha am foillseachadh seo ri fhaighinn ann an cruthannan is cànain eile ma nithear iarrtas.
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